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Editors' notes 

You may have noticed that CP's 
numbering scheme has 

changed. "Volume 1 number 1 
March 1989" has been superceded 
by "Number 2, Summer 1989." Ed 
Dahl, early cartography specialist 
with the National Archives of 
Canada, swayed us with ample 
(and amusing) evidence of the 
shortcomings of the volume/ 
number scheme. As long as we 
were adjusting things, we thought 
that dating by season rather than 
by month would be better too 
(under the former scheme, this 
issue would have been dated 
"June," which would not have 
been quite true). 

We do promise, however, that 
"Number 3, Fall 1989" will reach 
most of our readers in advance of 
the Annual Meeting (October 
11-14, Ann Arbor, Michigan). We 
invite all who may wish to contrib­
ute a software review, events 
report, "fugitive cartographic 
literature" review, maps-in-the­
news clipping, or cart lab bulletin 
board notice to contact us soon; to 
fulfill our promise, the deadline for 
submissions must be August 20! 

We do hope you find the current 
issue useful, and as always, we 
welcome your comments. 

David DiBiase & Karl Proehl 


